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Relieving Principal’s Report

Dear Parents and Carers,

Can you believe it is the end of Term 3! We’ve had many wonderful experiences and 
look forward to the exciting events and activities planned for Term 4. This is always a 
busy time of year, filled with opportunities for celebration, transition, and connection.

Last week our choir, dance ensemble and band went on the annual GPS Performing 
Arts Tour, which was an extraordinary experience for our students. It is always 
inspiring to see our talented young artists, musicians, and performers take to the 
stage in the ‘big smoke’. This camp provides a unique opportunity for our students to 
hone their skills, gain confidence, and experience the vibrant cultural life of the city. 
The performances were truly impressive, and I am so proud of each and every student 
who participated. They represented our school with great pride and showcased the 
incredible talent and potential we have within our school community. A huge thank 
you to Mr Keogh, Mr Craythorn, Ms Eveleigh, Miss Karen and Miss Selina for once 
again giving our students these once in a lifetime opportunities and memories they 
will cherish forever.

In Term 4, we will kick off our Transition Programs, an important time for students as 
they prepare for the next step in their educational journey. Our Kinder Kritters 
program will be in full swing as we welcome our youngest learners as they get a taste 
of school life. The Years 2-3 transition to the Primary Campus will help our students 
familiarise themselves with new routines and expectations. Similarly, the Year 6-7 
transition program will support our Year 6 students as they prepare for high school, 
ensuring they feel confident and ready for their next exciting chapter of schooling.

Our Year 6 students will also be celebrated at the much-anticipated Year 6 Farewell. 
This event is a special opportunity to acknowledge their contributions and 
achievements throughout their time at GPS. Before this, our annual Presentation Day 
will honour the outstanding efforts and accomplishments of students across all year 
levels.

We are thrilled to announce the official opening of our newly renovated school hall 
will occur next term! This state-of-the-art facility will serve as a hub for community 
events, assemblies, and performances for years to come.

We’re looking forward to hosting Grandparents Day at the very beginning of next 
term. A cherished tradition that allows us to celebrate the invaluable role 
grandparents and loved ones play in the lives of our students.

…Cont 



Relieving Principal’s Report

Our school’s involvement in the local Jacaranda Festival will be another highlight, 
showcasing our students' talents and community spirit. And of course, the term 
would not be complete without the delightful Infants Christmas Concert, where our 
youngest students will bring the festive season to life with their joy and enthusiasm.

Thank you for your ongoing support and involvement in our school community. See 
you all next term.

Nick Campbell
R/Principal
Grafton Public School
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